



Capitol Square Office  
Two East Mifflin Street  
Suite 600  
Madison, WI 53703-2865  
FAX 608-252-9243  
TEL 608-255-8891

To: WISCONSIN CENTRAL GROUP  
C/O WCG - STEERING COMMITTEE  
DEWITT ROSS & STEVENS, S.C.  
2 E. MIFFLIN STREET, SUITE 600  
MADISON, WI 53703

Date: August 5, 2011  
Invoice: 917323  
Client: 71729.000

Re: CANADIAN NATIONAL RAILWAY COMPANY

---

**To Professional Services**

		<b>Rate</b>	<b>Hours</b>	<b>Amount</b>
	<b>John Duncan Varda</b>			
06-30-11	NO CHARGE - Instructions to assistant re pulling Q&A segment from EP 705 hearing video, transcription (time prorated); further regarding preparation of reports, organization following Steering Committee meeting (notes)	0	0.70	0.00
06-30-11	NO CHARGE - Connect with B. Ridley regarding E. Burkhardt meeting; telephone conference to C. Wall, Texpar (message)	0	0.25	0.00
07-01-11	NO CHARGE - Telephone conference with A. Gould regarding background, briefing on Steering Committee meeting, follow-up; inquiry to E. Burkhardt regarding meeting; confirm date, email B. Ridley regarding same	0	0.90	0.00
07-02-11	NO CHARGE - STB EP 705: Edit report to Steering Committee and to Stakeholders, testimony as given	0	0.65	0.00
07-02-11	NO CHARGE - Draft Stakeholder Update No. 2	0	0.80	0.00
07-03-11	NO CHARGE - Edit Subscription Agreement and Remittance Form; draft template cover letter re Subscription Agreements for Steering Committee	0	1.20	0.00
07-05-11	NO CHARGE - Complete letters to Steering Committee regarding subscriptions; complete edit of report on EP 705 and testimony as given	0	2.50	0.00
07-05-11	Begin draft letter to V. Kachroo, outline for "Projects" and advice regarding right of independent action	385	2.50	962.50
07-05-11	Prepare Stakeholder Network Update No. 2	190	1.50	285.00
07-06-11	NO CHARGE - Quick research regarding rail-biomass transport	0	0.35	0.00
07-06-11	NO CHARGE - Complete and forward draft Kachroo letter to Steering Committee; email to Steering Committee regarding Kachroo letter input and meeting with Mr. Burkhardt, agenda	0	2.60	0.00
07-06-11	NO CHARGE - Instructions and error correction regarding Stakeholder Update No. 2	0	0.65	0.00



Date: August 5, 2011  
 Invoice: 917323  
 Client: 71729.000  
 Page: 2

Capitol Square Office  
 Two East Mifflin Street  
 Suite 600  
 Madison, WI 53703-2865  
 Fax 608-252-9243  
 Tel. 608-255-8891

---

<b>John Duncan Varda</b>				
07-07-11	NO CHARGE - Caution to Steering Committee regarding confidentiality of meeting with E. Burkhardt; update email to V. Kachroo, et al. at Canadian National; email exchanges with M. Graceffa regarding scheduling and subscription briefing; follow up with assistant on Network contacts adjustments, Verso contact additions	0	1.20	0.00
07-08-11	NO CHARGE - Review NITL petition, STB EP 711 (time prorated); circulate comments to Steering Committee	0	0.70	0.00
07-10-11	NO CHARGE - Complete E. Burkhardt meeting memorandum, topics	0	1.25	0.00
07-11-11	NO CHARGE - Email E. Burkhardt meeting topics and likely agenda for 7/20/2011 meeting to Steering Committee for comment	0	0.45	0.00
07-11-11	NO CHARGE - Respond to M. Robbins regarding invitation, meeting with Chairman Elliott on 8/16/2011; instructions regarding proofreading V. Kachroo letter and E. Burkhardt memo; begin review of marked-up proofs	0	0.75	0.00
07-12-11	Edit letter to V. Kachroo, follow-up on June 7th meeting, forward	385	1.50	577.50
07-12-11	NO CHARGE - Review K. Soucie email and letter to Blue Line Coalition; forward to Steering Committee with comment	0	0.85	0.00
07-13-11	Edit topics memorandum for Burkhardt meeting	385	1.25	481.25
07-13-11	NO CHARGE - Cover letter to Ed Burkhardt; respond to Blue Line, Dean Zuleger, regarding K. Soucie contact	0	0.40	0.00
07-14-11	NO CHARGE - Circulate Steering Committee agenda for July 21, 2011	0	0.50	0.00
07-15-11	Forward meeting agenda and attachments to E. Burkhardt; review response and further exchanges regarding meeting agenda and participants; further advice to B. Ridley and J. Culotta	385	1.70	654.50
07-15-11	NO CHARGE - Logs: email exchange with Pasi Lautala, scheduling	0	0.15	0.00
07-16-11	NO CHARGE - Email B. Ridley regarding scheduling	0	0.10	0.00
07-17-11	NO CHARGE - Further review of 2009-2010 log study, print out figures, map; prepare folders for meeting with J. Culotta, conference call with P. Lautala (Marquette Tech), and meeting with E. Burkhardt; notes	0	0.40	0.00



Date: August 5, 2011  
 Invoice: 917323  
 Client: 71729.000  
 Page: 3

Capitol Square Office  
 Two East Mifflin Street  
 Suite 600  
 Madison, WI 53703-2865  
 Fax 608-252-9243  
 Tel. 608-255-8891

---

<b>John Duncan Varda</b>				
07-18-11	NO CHARGE - telephone conference with Pasi Lautala, Michigan Tech, regarding biomass transportation study, Kinross facility and Low Peninsula short line interests; telephone conference with K. Korpi regarding MFPC participation (time prorated); telephone conference with D.J. Aderman, Johnson Timber, regarding state of CN service, pricing on log traffic and related; email exchange with P. Burris regarding URCS detail, availability of revenue/variable cost ratios and pricing; further review of files on log studies and biomass transport factors; sort through log project history, related	0	1.80	0.00
07-19-11	NO CHARGE - Travel to Chicago, O'Hare area; dinner meeting with B. Ridley, discussion regarding WCGroup project and meeting with E. Burkhardt	0	4.50	0.00
07-20-11	NO CHARGE - Email contacts with Wolf River Lumber Company, Green Bay Packaging and Johnson/Flambeau River; advice from M. Christopher	0	0.60	0.00
07-20-11	NO CHARGE - At Rosemont, complete meeting preparation, travel from hotel to offices of Rail World, Inc.	0	1.10	0.00
07-20-11	At Rosemont, conference with E. Burkhardt, B. Shauer, B. Ridley and J. Culotta	385	2.50	962.50
07-20-11	NO CHARGE - Return travel from Rosemont to Madison	0	3.00	0.00
07-21-11	At WMC, Steering Committee conference call	190	1.25	237.50
07-22-11	NO CHARGE - Follow-up on scheduling shipper appointments for 8/26/2011	0	0.30	0.00
07-22-11	Thank you and agenda email to E. Burkhardt and Bill Schauer; circulate to Steering Committee	190	0.65	123.50
07-24-11	NO CHARGE - Follow-up message, contact Green Bay Packaging	0	0.15	0.00
07-25-11	NO CHARGE - Assembly of materials and background reviews for meetings with Wolf River and Green Bay Packaging and related contacts; respond to D. Calabro, PCA, regarding tax identification number question; advice to others regarding same	0	1.40	0.00
07-25-11	NO CHARGE - Further markup and assembly of materials for meeting with Wolf River and Green Bay Packaging	0	0.40	0.00
07-26-11	At new London, meet with Wolf River Lumber Company, M. Christopher, Operations Manager, and J. Carrigan, Marketing Manager; at Green Bay, meet with M. DePrey, Green Bay Packaging, Purchasing Manager	385	2.00	770.00
07-26-11	NO CHARGE - Travel related to shipper meetings at New London and Green Bay (prorated with others)	0	3.00	0.00
07-26-11	NO CHARGE - Notes regarding agenda, meetings follow-up	0	0.50	0.00



Date: August 5, 2011  
 Invoice: 917323  
 Client: 71729.000  
 Page: 4

Capitol Square Office  
 Two East Mifflin Street  
 Suite 600  
 Madison, WI 53703-2865  
 Fax 608-252-9243  
 Tel. 608-255-8891

---

<b>John Duncan Varda</b>				
07-27-11	NO CHARGE - Follow-up contacts with Green Bay Packaging and Wolf River; contact City of New London, K. Hager, regarding export weight permits; brainstorm follow-up shipper contacts and monitoring	0	1.80	0.00
07-28-11	NO CHARGE - Follow up from Mark Christopher, Wolf River Lumber, New London	0	0.15	0.00
Total Current Professional Services		99	50.90	5,054.25
<b>Total Current Services and Disbursements</b>				<b>5,054.25</b>
<b>TOTAL DUE, PLEASE PAY THIS AMOUNT</b>				<b>5,054.25</b>
<b>RE: CANADIAN NATIONAL RAILWAY COMPANY</b>				

<u>Trust Account Activity for this Invoice</u>	
Trust Account Balance as of 08-05-11	10,000.00
Application of Trust to Balance Due on Account	0.00
Balance Remaining in Trust as of 08-05-11	10,000.00